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ANSWER ALL QUESTIONS
PART-A (10x2=20 marks)

1. Define productivity.

2. Explain the terms effectiveness and efficiency.

3. What is budget?

4. Differentiate between short range and long range plans.

5. State the difference between formal and informal
organization.

6.  What is empowerment?

7. State Herzberg’s motivation hygiene theory
8.  What is charismatic leadership?

9.  What is benchmarking?

10. Define M-Commerce.
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PART-B (5x16=80 marks)

Diagrammatical]y illustrate and discuss the
systems approach to management,

Or

Identify  the various approaches o
management analys Discuss the
characteristics and contributions as well as
their limitations.

What is planning? Diagramm;ltically illustrate
and discuss the steps involved in planning,

Or

() Explain the terms certainty, uncertainty,
risk and decision making.

(i)  Explain how decision making is done
under certainty, uncertainty and risk.

What is  business brocess reengineering?
Discuss  how an organization can he
reengineered? Give relevant example.

Or

What is human resource management?
Discuss the systems approach to human
resource management,

(i)  Explain the expectancy theory of
motivation,
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(i)  Explain the goal setting theory for
motivation.

(itl)  Explain Skinner’s reinforcement theory
Or

Present a tutorial on committees, teams and
group decision making

(i)  What is return on investment? Discuss
control through return on investment.

(i)  What is time event network analysis?
Discuss the same with an cxample.

Or

List and discuss the opportunities and
challenges created by information technology.
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